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10/20/22, 1:38 PM Town of Medfield Mail - Request for permit

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2c9f17abf6&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a%3Ar7980136939257135793&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-a%3Ar798… 1/1

Brittney Franklin <bfranklin@medfield.net>

Request for permit 

Brittney Franklin <bfranklin@medfield.net> Thu, Oct 20, 2022 at 1:38 PM
To: Brittney Franklin <bfranklin@medfield.net>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Rick Fink 
Date: Wed, Oct 12, 2022 at 10:15 AM 
Subject: Request for permit 
To: <bfranklin@medfield.net> 

Hi Brittney, 

Thank you for taking my call. As discussed, I want to host a community event on Wednesday, November 23 from 11:30 - 3:00 p.m.

The purpose is to provide Medfield's school children a fun and safe event following their early release from school.

We would like to provide entertainment and free food and drink for all members of the community as we head into Thanksgiving.

Hopefully this will turn into an annual tradition in Medfield.

Thank you for your time. 

Sincerely,
Rick Fink

mailto:bfranklin@medfield.net




10/20/22, 12:39 PM Town of Medfield Mail - Re: Deerfield Drive

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2c9f17abf6&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a%3Ar-5775513097616048939&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-a%3Ar-5… 1/1

Brittney Franklin <bfranklin@medfield.net>

Re: Deerfield Drive 

Brittney Franklin <bfranklin@medfield.net> Thu, Oct 20, 2022 at 12:39 PM
To: Brittney Franklin <bfranklin@medfield.net>

On Fri, Sep 16, 2022 at 7:49 AM Will Lui < > wrote: 
Hello Ms. Trierweiler, 
 
Can you please advise as to the procedure to obtain time in a scheduled Town meeting to discuss and ongoing concern/issue with
Deerfield Drive? 
 
We would like to understand the town’s position concerning this Drive and present the residents’ views and understanding prior-to
and after purchasing property and residing on Deerfield Drive. 
 
Should there be another person to contact regarding this, please provide the contact and/or forward this email to the responsible
party.  
 
We appreciate your assistance regarding this issue. We look forward to your reply. 
 
Best regards, 
Will





 

 
 

MAURICE GOULET 
Director 

TOWN OF MEDFIELD 
Office of 

 

DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS 
 

MEDFIELD, MASSACHUSETTS 

 
TO: Board of Selectmen 
FROM: Maurice Goulet, Director of Public Works 

DATE: October 19, 2022 

RE: Joint Purchase of Salt 2022-2023 Bid Results 
 

It is hereby recommended that the following bids be awarded to the following 
responsive and responsible vendors in accordance with the Town of Medfield bid 
specifications: 
 

 Rock Salt  Primary Bidder: Eastern Minerals, Inc. 
Secondary Bidder: Morton Salt Co. 

 Solar Salt  Primary Bidder: Eastern Minerals, Inc. 
Secondary Bidder : Morton Salt Co. 

 Treated Salt  Primary Bidder: Eastern Minerals, Inc. 
Secondary Bidder : Morton Salt Co. 

 

BID RESULTS: ($ price per ton) 
 

     Rock Salt  Solar Salt  Treated Salt 
 
Eastern Minerals, Inc. $72.50  $82.50  $92.50 
(picked up price)  $72.50  $82.50  $92.50 
 
Morton Salt Co.  $78.03  $85.20  $94.03 
(picked up price)  $78.00  $85.00  $94.00 
 
American Rock Salt  $84.95  $0.00   $0.00 
(picked up price)  $79.95  $0.00   $0.00 
 
Cargill    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 
Mid-American Salt  Disqualified - No Bid Bond  
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TOWN OF MEDFIELD, MASSACHUSETTS 
 

AGREEMENT 
 

CONTRACT #  DPW 2022-12 
 

STATE CONTRACT # (if applicable) ___________________ 
 

This Contract is made this 25th  day of October 2022 by and between the Town of Medfield, a Municipal 
Corporation, duly organized under the laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts and having a usual place of 
business at the Town House Building, 459 Main Street in said Medfield, MA 02052 hereinafter referred to as the 
“Town” and Eastern Minerals, Inc., having a usual place of business at 134 Middle Street, Suite 210, Lowell MA 
01852, hereinafter referred to as the “Contractor”. 

WITNESSED: 

Whereas, the Contractor submitted a Proposal to the Town to deliver road salt for winter operations, hereinafter 
referred to as the "Program” and the Town has decided to award the contract, therefore to the Contractor. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE Town and the Contractor agree as follows: 

1. Contract Documents:   The Contract Documents consist of this Agreement together with the Contractor’s 
Quotation for Scope of Work and Compensation only (Attachment A) as a primary supplier. The Contract 
Documents constitute the entire Agreement between the parties concerning the services and all are as fully a 
part of this Agreement as if attached hereto. In the event of conflicting provisions, the language of this 
Agreement shall govern provided that if the conflict relates to quantity or quality of goods or services, the 
greater quantity or higher quality specified shall be required. 
 

2. Scope of Services:   The Contractor shall furnish road salt related to the Program in accordance with the Scope 
of Services provided in Attachment A, as well as, all services necessary or incidental thereto. 

 
3. Performance of Work:   The Contractor shall furnish all equipment, staffing, and materials to accomplish the 

Program in strict conformity with all applicable Federal, State, and local laws, each of which is incorporated by 
reference and shall be responsible for obtaining all necessary approvals/permits as required for the performance 
of the Program.  
 

4. Warranties:   The Contractor warrants that all goods are in strict conformity with the Contract Documents. The 
Contractor shall replace, repair, or make good, without cost to the Town, any defects or faults arising within one 
(1) year after date of Town’s acceptance of articles furnished hereunder (acceptance not to be unreasonably 
delayed) resulting from imperfect or defective work done or materials furnished by the Contractor. 
 

5. Delivery: The Contractor shall deliver the Road Salt FOB to the Medfield Department of Public Works, 55 
North Meadows Road, Medfield, MA 02052 or to another location within the Town of Medfield, as Town may 
direct in writing.  
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6. Contract Term:   The Contract Term is as follows: October 25, 2022  through October 25, 2023 subject to 
annual appropriation and pricing from the Contractor. 

 
7. Payment for Work:    The Town shall pay $72.50 per ton delivered or picked up for the Program in accordance 

with the pricing in Attachment A. The Contractor to Town shall submit invoices for payment for the Program 
according to terms set forth by the Town. The Town shall make payments within thirty (30) days after its 
receipt of the invoice. 

 
8. Indemnification of the Town:   The Town’s liability hereunder shall be limited to the amounts due the 

Contractor for services actually rendered. The Contractor shall indemnify and hold harmless the Town, its 
officers, boards, agents and employees to the maximum extent permitted by law, from any liability loss, 
damage, cost, charge, or expense resulting from any employees or third party contractor or supplier’s claim for 
payment for wages, labor, materials, goods or services rendered to Contractor or from any claim for injury to 
person or property, which be made as a result of any act, omission or default on the part of the Contractor, or 
any of its agents or employees and will pay promptly on demand all costs and expenses of the investigation 
thereof, including attorney’s fees and expenses. If any such claim is made, the Town may retain out of any 
payments, then or thereafter due to the Contractor a sufficient amount to protect the Town against such claims, 
costs and expenses. 

 
9. Contractor's Standard of Care.  In providing services under this Agreement, the Contractor will endeavor to 

perform in a manner consistent with that degree of care and skill ordinarily exercised by members of the road 
salt industry currently practicing under similar circumstances.  Upon notice to the Contractor and by mutual 
agreement between the parties, the Contractor will, without additional compensation, correct those services not 
meeting such a standard. 

 
10.  Contractor’s Personnel:   The Contractor shall utilize only its employees and shall not utilize any third-party 

contractors without prior written approval of the Town. 
 

11. Insurance:   The Contractor shall provide the following insurance policies. The Town will require a Certificate 
of Insurance, indicating evidence of General Liability, Automobile Liability with minimum limits of 
$2,000,000.00 and Worker’s Compensation (per Statute). The Town will require the Certificate of Insurance to 
include naming the Town of Medfield as an additional insured. 

 
12. Independent Contractor:   The Contractor is an independent contractor and is not an agent or employee of the 

Town and is not authorized to act on behalf of the Town. The Town will not withhold Federal, State or payroll 
taxes of any kind, on behalf of the Contractor or the employees of the Contractor. The Contractor is not eligible 
for, and shall not participate in, any employee pension, health or other fringe benefit plan of the Town. 

 
13. Successors and Assigns:   This Agreement is binding upon the parties hereto, their successors, assigns and legal 

representatives. Neither the Town nor the Contractor shall assign or transfer any interest in the Agreement 
without the written consent of the other. 

 
14. Inspection and Reports:   The Town shall have the right to inspect the records of the Contractor relative to the 

services provided to the Town pursuant to this Agreement. Upon request the Contractor shall furnish to the 
Town any and all written reports relative to such services arising out of its operations under this Contract during 
and/or after the termination of the contract. 

 
15. Termination:    
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a. For Cause – The Town shall have the right to terminate this Agreement if (i) the Contractor neglects or 
fails to perform or observe any of its obligations hereunder and a cure is not effected by the Contractor 
within seven (7) days next following its receipt of a termination notice issued by the Town, (ii) if an 
order is entered against the Contractor approving a petition for an arrangement, liquidation, dissolution 
or similar relief relating to bankruptcy or insolvency and such order remains unvacated for thirty (30) 
days; or (iii) immediately if the Contractor shall file a voluntary petition in bankruptcy or any petition 
or answer seeking any arrangement, liquidation or dissolution relating to bankruptcy, insolvency or 
other relief for debtors or shall seek or consent or acquiesce in appointment of any trustee, receiver or 
liquidation of any of the Contractor’s property.  
 
The Town shall pay all reasonable and supportable costs incurred prior to termination, which payment 
shall not exceed the value of services provided. 
  

b. For Convenience – The Town may terminate this Agreement at any time for any reason upon 
submitting to the Contractor thirty (30) days prior a written notice of its intention to terminate. Upon 
receipt of such notice, the Contractor shall immediately cease to incur expenses pursuant to this 
Agreement unless otherwise directed in the Town’s termination notice. The Contractor shall promptly 
notify the Town of costs incurred to date of termination and the Town shall pay all such reasonable and 
supportable costs which payment shall not exceed the unpaid balance due on this Agreement. 
  

c. Return of Property – Upon termination, the Contractor shall immediately return to the Town, without 
limitation, all documents and items of any nature whatever, supplied to the Contractor by the Town or 
developed by the Contractor in accordance with this Agreement. 

 
16. Notice:   Any and all notices, or other communications required or permitted under this Contract, shall be in 

writing and delivered by hand or mailed postage prepaid, return receipt requested, be registered or certified mail 
or by other reputable delivery service, to the parties at the address set forth on Page 1 or furnished from time to 
time in writing hereafter by one party to the other party. Any such notice or correspondence shall be deemed 
given when so delivered by hand, if so mailed, when deposited with the U.S. Postal Service or, if sent by private 
overnight or other delivery service. 
  

17. Severability:   If any term of this Contractor application thereof shall to any extent be held invalid, illegal or 
unenforceable by the court of competent jurisdiction, legality, and enforceability of the remaining terms and 
conditions of the Contract shall not be deemed affected thereby unless one or both parties would be 
substantially or materially prejudiced. 

 
18. Governing Law:   The performance of this Contract shall be governed, construed and enforced in accordance 

with the laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts, Claims and Disputes and Resolution Procedure. Claims, 
disputes, or other matters in question with the Town and Contractor or any other party claiming rights under this 
Agreement relating to or arising from the Project, the Work, or interpretation of any terms of the Contract or 
Contract Documents shall be resolved only by a civil action commenced in the Commonwealth of 
Massachusetts in either the Superior Court Department, Norfolk County, or the District Court Department, 
Dedham Division, of Massachusetts Trial Court; in the alternative, private arbitration or mediation may be 
employed if the parties mutually agree in writing to do so. 

 
19. Entire Agreement:   This Contract, including all documents incorporated herein by reference, constitutes the 

entire integrated agreement between the parties with respect to the matters described. This contract supersedes 
all prior agreements; negotiations, either written or oral and it shall not be modified or amended except by a 
written document executed by the parties hereto. 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this Agreement on this day and 
year first above written. 

  

(Contractor)       Board of Selectmen 
 
 
By: ____________________________________   ____________________________________ 
 
Title: ___________________________________   ____________________________________ 
    
        ____________________________________ 
 
         
   
       
Approved as to Form:   _____      Town of Medfield, MA  
  
     
 
____________________________________  _______ ____________________________________ 
Mark G. Cerel, Town Attorney        Kristine Trierweiler, Town Administrator 
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CERTIFICATION OF GOOD FAITH 
 

The undersigned certifies under pains and penalties of perjury that this contract has been obtained in good faith and 

without collusion or fraud with any other person.  As used in this certification, the word “person” shall mean any 

natural person, business, partnership, corporation, union, committee, club, or other organization, entity, or group of 

individuals. 

The Contractor by:  ________________________________________ 
    Print Name 
 
 
    ________________________________________ 
    Title/Authority 
 

 

 

 

CERTIFICATE OF STATE TAX COMPLIANCE 

 

 Pursuant to Massachusetts General Laws, Chapter 62C, Section 49A 

_____________________________________, authorized signatory for  
 name of signatory 
 
___________________________________________________, whose  

                                name of contractor 
 

principal place of business is at _________________________________________________, 

 _____________________________does hereby certify under the pains and penalties of perjury that 
_________________________________________________________ has paid all  

name of contractor 
 

Massachusetts taxes and has complied with all laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts relating to taxes, 
reporting of employees and contractors, and withholding and remitting child support. 

 

 

       ___________________________________ 
Signature    Date
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EXAMPLE CLERK’S CERTIFICATE 

_______________________________ 

Action of Shareholders 

Written Consent 

(Date) 

 The undersigned, being the Shareholders of ________________________, a Massachusetts Corporation 
(the "Corporation") entitled to vote on the action, hereby consent to the adoption of the following votes: 

VOTED: That the [President and/or the Vice President or named individual], each of them acting 
singly is, authorized to execute any and all contract documents and to enter into and 
negotiate the terms of all contracts and to accomplish same and to execute any and all 
documents, instruments, and agreements in order to effectuate the transaction and that 
said transaction shall be valid, binding, effective, and legally enforceable. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time, in 
the name and on behalf of the Corporation to take or cause to be taken all such action(s) 
as s/he or they, as the case may be, deem necessary, appropriate or advisable to effect the 
foregoing votes, as may be shown by the officer or officers execution or performance 
which shall be conclusive evidence that the same is authorized by the directors of this 
Corporation. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time, in 
the name and on behalf of this Corporation, under its corporate seal, if desired, attested 
by an appropriate officer, if desired, to execute, make oath to, acknowledge, deliver and 
file any and all of the agreements, instruments, certificates and documents referred to or 
related to the foregoing votes. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time and 
on behalf of this Corporation, under its corporate seal, if desired, to execute, 
acknowledge and deliver any and all agreements, instruments, certificates and documents 
referred to or related to the foregoing votes, with such changes as the officer or officers 
so acting may deem necessary or desirable, and the signature of such officer or officers to 
be conclusive evidence that the same is authorized by the directors of this Corporation. 

Clerk of Corporation Certificate 

 

I, ___________________________ the Clerk of the foregoing corporation, do hereby certify that the above vote was 
taken at a duly called meeting of the shareholders of the Corporation on _____________, 20__. 

 
____________________________ 
Clerk of Corporation 
 

SEAL 



 

ATTACHMENT 

 

A 
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TOWN OF MEDFIELD, MASSACHUSETTS 
 

AGREEMENT 
 

CONTRACT #  DPW 2022-13 
 

STATE CONTRACT # (if applicable) ___________________ 
 

This Contract is made this 25th  day of October 2022 by and between the Town of Medfield, a Municipal 
Corporation, duly organized under the laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts and having a usual place of 
business at the Town House Building, 459 Main Street in said Medfield, MA 02052 hereinafter referred to as the 
“Town” and Morton Salt Co., having a usual place of business at 444 W. Lake Street, Chicago, IL 60606, 
hereinafter referred to as the “Contractor”. 

WITNESSED: 

Whereas, the Contractor submitted a Proposal to the Town to deliver road salt for winter operations, hereinafter 
referred to as the "Program” and the Town has decided to award the contract, therefore to the Contractor. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE Town and the Contractor agree as follows: 

1. Contract Documents:   The Contract Documents consist of this Agreement together with the Contractor’s 
Quotation for Scope of Work and Compensation only (Attachment A) as a secondary supplier. The Contract 
Documents constitute the entire Agreement between the parties concerning the services and all are as fully a 
part of this Agreement as if attached hereto. In the event of conflicting provisions, the language of this 
Agreement shall govern provided that if the conflict relates to quantity or quality of goods or services, the 
greater quantity or higher quality specified shall be required. 
 

2. Scope of Services:   The Contractor shall furnish road salt related to the Program in accordance with the Scope 
of Services provided in Attachment A, as well as, all services necessary or incidental thereto. 

 
3. Performance of Work:   The Contractor shall furnish all equipment, staffing, and materials to accomplish the 

Program in strict conformity with all applicable Federal, State, and local laws, each of which is incorporated by 
reference and shall be responsible for obtaining all necessary approvals/permits as required for the performance 
of the Program.  
 

4. Warranties:   The Contractor warrants that all goods are in strict conformity with the Contract Documents. The 
Contractor shall replace, repair, or make good, without cost to the Town, any defects or faults arising within one 
(1) year after date of Town’s acceptance of articles furnished hereunder (acceptance not to be unreasonably 
delayed) resulting from imperfect or defective work done or materials furnished by the Contractor. 
 

5. Delivery: The Contractor shall deliver the Road Salt FOB to the Medfield Department of Public Works, 55 
North Meadows Road, Medfield, MA 02052 or to another location within the Town of Medfield, as Town may 
direct in writing.  
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6. Contract Term:   The Contract Term is as follows: October 25, 2022  through October 25, 2023 subject to 
annual appropriation and pricing from the Contractor. 

 
7. Payment for Work:    The Town shall pay $78.03 per ton delivered and $78.00 picked up for the Program in 

accordance with the pricing in Attachment A. The Contractor to Town shall submit invoices for payment for the 
Program according to terms set forth by the Town. The Town shall make payments within thirty (30) days after 
its receipt of the invoice. 

 
8. Indemnification of the Town:   The Town’s liability hereunder shall be limited to the amounts due the 

Contractor for services actually rendered. The Contractor shall indemnify and hold harmless the Town, its 
officers, boards, agents and employees to the maximum extent permitted by law, from any liability loss, 
damage, cost, charge, or expense resulting from any employees or third party contractor or supplier’s claim for 
payment for wages, labor, materials, goods or services rendered to Contractor or from any claim for injury to 
person or property, which be made as a result of any act, omission or default on the part of the Contractor, or 
any of its agents or employees and will pay promptly on demand all costs and expenses of the investigation 
thereof, including attorney’s fees and expenses. If any such claim is made, the Town may retain out of any 
payments, then or thereafter due to the Contractor a sufficient amount to protect the Town against such claims, 
costs and expenses. 

 
9. Contractor's Standard of Care.  In providing services under this Agreement, the Contractor will endeavor to 

perform in a manner consistent with that degree of care and skill ordinarily exercised by members of the road 
salt industry currently practicing under similar circumstances.  Upon notice to the Contractor and by mutual 
agreement between the parties, the Contractor will, without additional compensation, correct those services not 
meeting such a standard. 

 
10.  Contractor’s Personnel:   The Contractor shall utilize only its employees and shall not utilize any third-party 

contractors without prior written approval of the Town. 
 

11. Insurance:   The Contractor shall provide the following insurance policies. The Town will require a Certificate 
of Insurance, indicating evidence of General Liability, Automobile Liability with minimum limits of 
$2,000,000.00 and Worker’s Compensation (per Statute). The Town will require the Certificate of Insurance to 
include naming the Town of Medfield as an additional insured. 

 
12. Independent Contractor:   The Contractor is an independent contractor and is not an agent or employee of the 

Town and is not authorized to act on behalf of the Town. The Town will not withhold Federal, State or payroll 
taxes of any kind, on behalf of the Contractor or the employees of the Contractor. The Contractor is not eligible 
for, and shall not participate in, any employee pension, health or other fringe benefit plan of the Town. 

 
13. Successors and Assigns:   This Agreement is binding upon the parties hereto, their successors, assigns and legal 

representatives. Neither the Town nor the Contractor shall assign or transfer any interest in the Agreement 
without the written consent of the other. 

 
14. Inspection and Reports:   The Town shall have the right to inspect the records of the Contractor relative to the 

services provided to the Town pursuant to this Agreement. Upon request the Contractor shall furnish to the 
Town any and all written reports relative to such services arising out of its operations under this Contract during 
and/or after the termination of the contract. 

 
15. Termination:    
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a. For Cause – The Town shall have the right to terminate this Agreement if (i) the Contractor neglects or 
fails to perform or observe any of its obligations hereunder and a cure is not effected by the Contractor 
within seven (7) days next following its receipt of a termination notice issued by the Town, (ii) if an 
order is entered against the Contractor approving a petition for an arrangement, liquidation, dissolution 
or similar relief relating to bankruptcy or insolvency and such order remains unvacated for thirty (30) 
days; or (iii) immediately if the Contractor shall file a voluntary petition in bankruptcy or any petition 
or answer seeking any arrangement, liquidation or dissolution relating to bankruptcy, insolvency or 
other relief for debtors or shall seek or consent or acquiesce in appointment of any trustee, receiver or 
liquidation of any of the Contractor’s property.  
 
The Town shall pay all reasonable and supportable costs incurred prior to termination, which payment 
shall not exceed the value of services provided. 
  

b. For Convenience – The Town may terminate this Agreement at any time for any reason upon 
submitting to the Contractor thirty (30) days prior a written notice of its intention to terminate. Upon 
receipt of such notice, the Contractor shall immediately cease to incur expenses pursuant to this 
Agreement unless otherwise directed in the Town’s termination notice. The Contractor shall promptly 
notify the Town of costs incurred to date of termination and the Town shall pay all such reasonable and 
supportable costs which payment shall not exceed the unpaid balance due on this Agreement. 
  

c. Return of Property – Upon termination, the Contractor shall immediately return to the Town, without 
limitation, all documents and items of any nature whatever, supplied to the Contractor by the Town or 
developed by the Contractor in accordance with this Agreement. 

 
16. Notice:   Any and all notices, or other communications required or permitted under this Contract, shall be in 

writing and delivered by hand or mailed postage prepaid, return receipt requested, be registered or certified mail 
or by other reputable delivery service, to the parties at the address set forth on Page 1 or furnished from time to 
time in writing hereafter by one party to the other party. Any such notice or correspondence shall be deemed 
given when so delivered by hand, if so mailed, when deposited with the U.S. Postal Service or, if sent by private 
overnight or other delivery service. 
  

17. Severability:   If any term of this Contractor application thereof shall to any extent be held invalid, illegal or 
unenforceable by the court of competent jurisdiction, legality, and enforceability of the remaining terms and 
conditions of the Contract shall not be deemed affected thereby unless one or both parties would be 
substantially or materially prejudiced. 

 
18. Governing Law:   The performance of this Contract shall be governed, construed and enforced in accordance 

with the laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts, Claims and Disputes and Resolution Procedure. Claims, 
disputes, or other matters in question with the Town and Contractor or any other party claiming rights under this 
Agreement relating to or arising from the Project, the Work, or interpretation of any terms of the Contract or 
Contract Documents shall be resolved only by a civil action commenced in the Commonwealth of 
Massachusetts in either the Superior Court Department, Norfolk County, or the District Court Department, 
Dedham Division, of Massachusetts Trial Court; in the alternative, private arbitration or mediation may be 
employed if the parties mutually agree in writing to do so. 

 
19. Entire Agreement:   This Contract, including all documents incorporated herein by reference, constitutes the 

entire integrated agreement between the parties with respect to the matters described. This contract supersedes 
all prior agreements; negotiations, either written or oral and it shall not be modified or amended except by a 
written document executed by the parties hereto. 



4 
 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this Agreement on this day and 
year first above written. 

  

(Contractor)       Board of Selectmen 
 
 
By: ____________________________________   ____________________________________ 
 
Title: ___________________________________   ____________________________________ 
    
        ____________________________________ 
 
         
   
       
Approved as to Form:   _____      Town of Medfield, MA  
  
     
 
____________________________________  _______ ____________________________________ 
Mark G. Cerel, Town Attorney        Kristine Trierweiler, Town Administrator 
     

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



5 
 

CERTIFICATION OF GOOD FAITH 
 

The undersigned certifies under pains and penalties of perjury that this contract has been obtained in good faith and 

without collusion or fraud with any other person.  As used in this certification, the word “person” shall mean any 

natural person, business, partnership, corporation, union, committee, club, or other organization, entity, or group of 

individuals. 

The Contractor by:  ________________________________________ 
    Print Name 
 
 
    ________________________________________ 
    Title/Authority 
 

 

 

 

CERTIFICATE OF STATE TAX COMPLIANCE 

 

 Pursuant to Massachusetts General Laws, Chapter 62C, Section 49A 

_____________________________________, authorized signatory for  
 name of signatory 
 
___________________________________________________, whose  

                                name of contractor 
 

principal place of business is at _________________________________________________, 

 _____________________________does hereby certify under the pains and penalties of perjury that 
_________________________________________________________ has paid all  

name of contractor 
 

Massachusetts taxes and has complied with all laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts relating to taxes, 
reporting of employees and contractors, and withholding and remitting child support. 

 

 

       ___________________________________ 
Signature    Date
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EXAMPLE CLERK’S CERTIFICATE 

_______________________________ 

Action of Shareholders 

Written Consent 

(Date) 

 The undersigned, being the Shareholders of ________________________, a Massachusetts Corporation 
(the "Corporation") entitled to vote on the action, hereby consent to the adoption of the following votes: 

VOTED: That the [President and/or the Vice President or named individual], each of them acting 
singly is, authorized to execute any and all contract documents and to enter into and 
negotiate the terms of all contracts and to accomplish same and to execute any and all 
documents, instruments, and agreements in order to effectuate the transaction and that 
said transaction shall be valid, binding, effective, and legally enforceable. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time, in 
the name and on behalf of the Corporation to take or cause to be taken all such action(s) 
as s/he or they, as the case may be, deem necessary, appropriate or advisable to effect the 
foregoing votes, as may be shown by the officer or officers execution or performance 
which shall be conclusive evidence that the same is authorized by the directors of this 
Corporation. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time, in 
the name and on behalf of this Corporation, under its corporate seal, if desired, attested 
by an appropriate officer, if desired, to execute, make oath to, acknowledge, deliver and 
file any and all of the agreements, instruments, certificates and documents referred to or 
related to the foregoing votes. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time and 
on behalf of this Corporation, under its corporate seal, if desired, to execute, 
acknowledge and deliver any and all agreements, instruments, certificates and documents 
referred to or related to the foregoing votes, with such changes as the officer or officers 
so acting may deem necessary or desirable, and the signature of such officer or officers to 
be conclusive evidence that the same is authorized by the directors of this Corporation. 

Clerk of Corporation Certificate 

 

I, ___________________________ the Clerk of the foregoing corporation, do hereby certify that the above vote was 
taken at a duly called meeting of the shareholders of the Corporation on _____________, 20__. 

 
____________________________ 
Clerk of Corporation 
 

SEAL 



 

ATTACHMENT 

 

A 
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TOWN OF MEDFIELD, MASSACHUSETTS 
 

AGREEMENT 
CONTRACT #  DPW 2022-11 

STATE CONTRACT # (if applicable) ___________________ 
 

This Contract is made this 25th  day of October 2022 by and between the Town of Medfield, a Municipal 
Corporation, duly organized under the laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts and having a usual place of 
business at the Town House Building, 459 Main Street in said Medfield, MA 02052 hereinafter referred to as the 
“Town” and Green Mattress Recycling, LLC., having a usual place of business at 6 Industrial Road, Milford, MA 
01747,  hereinafter referred to as the “Contractor”. 

WITNESSED: 

Whereas, the Contractor submitted a Proposal to the Town to perform mattress recycling work, hereinafter referred 
to as the "Program” and the Town has decided to award the contract, therefore to the Contractor. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE Town and the Contractor agree as follows: 

1. Contract Documents:   The Contract Documents consist of this Agreement together with the Contractor’s 
Quotation for Scope of Work and Compensation only (Attachment A). The Contract Documents constitute the 
entire Agreement between the parties concerning the services and all are as fully a part of this Agreement as if 
attached hereto. In the event of conflicting provisions, the language of this Agreement shall govern provided 
that if the conflict relates to quantity or quality of goods or services, the greater quantity or higher quality 
specified shall be required. 
 

2. Scope of Services:   The Contractor shall furnish mattress recycling services related to the Program in 
accordance with the Scope of Services provided in Attachment A, as well as, all services necessary or incidental 
thereto. 

 
3. Performance of Work:   The Contractor shall furnish all equipment, staffing, and materials to accomplish the 

Program in strict conformity with all applicable Federal, State, and local laws, each of which is incorporated by 
reference and shall be responsible for obtaining all necessary approvals/permits as required for the performance 
of the Program.  
 

4. Warranties:   The Contractor warrants that all work will be performed in a good and workmanlike manner and 
in strict conformity with the Contract Documents. The Contractor shall replace, repair, or make good, without 
cost to the Town, any defects or faults arising within one (1) year after date of Town’s acceptance of articles 
furnished hereunder (acceptance not to be unreasonably delayed) resulting from imperfect or defective work 
done or materials furnished by the Contractor. 

 
5. Contract Term:   The Contract Term is as follows: October 25, 2022  through December 31, 2023 subject to 

annual appropriation and pricing from the Contractor. 
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6. Payment for Work:    The Town shall pay $35.00 per piece (ex. mattress or box spring) for the Program with a 
$400.00 transportation fee for each container load (approx. 50 mattresses) in accordance with the pricing in 
Attachment A. The Contractor to Town shall submit invoices for payment for the Program according to terms 
set forth by the Town. The Town shall make payments within thirty (30) days after its receipt of the invoice. 

 
7. Indemnification of the Town:   The Town’s liability hereunder shall be limited to the amounts due the 

Contractor for services actually rendered. The Contractor shall indemnify and hold harmless the Town, its 
officers, boards, agents and employees to the maximum extent permitted by law, from any liability loss, 
damage, cost, charge, or expense resulting from any employees or third party contractor or supplier’s claim for 
payment for wages, labor, materials, goods or services rendered to Contractor or from any claim for injury to 
person or property, which be made as a result of any act, omission or default on the part of the Contractor, or 
any of its agents or employees and will pay promptly on demand all costs and expenses of the investigation 
thereof, including attorney’s fees and expenses. If any such claim is made, the Town may retain out of any 
payments, then or thereafter due to the Contractor a sufficient amount to protect the Town against such claims, 
costs and expenses. 

 
8. Contractor's Standard of Care.  In providing services under this Agreement, the Contractor will endeavor to 

perform in a manner consistent with that degree of care and skill ordinarily exercised by members of the 
mattress recycling industry currently practicing under similar circumstances.  Upon notice to the Contractor and 
by mutual agreement between the parties, the Contractor will, without additional compensation, correct those 
services not meeting such a standard. Contractor represents that it is familiar with and knowledgeable about 
federal and state statutes and regulations, as well as private industry standards, relating to proper transportation, 
recycling and disposal of mattresses and will comply fully therewith. 

 
9.  Contractor’s Personnel:   The Contractor shall utilize only its employees and shall not utilize any third-party 

contractors without prior written approval of the Town. 
 

10. Insurance:   The Contractor shall provide the following insurance policies. The Town will require a Certificate 
of Insurance, indicating evidence of General Liability, Automobile Liability with minimum limits of 
$2,000,000.00 and Worker’s Compensation (per Statute). The Town will require the Certificate of Insurance to 
include naming the Town of Medfield as an additional insured. 

 
11. Independent Contractor:   The Contractor is an independent contractor and is not an agent or employee of the 

Town and is not authorized to act on behalf of the Town. The Town will not withhold Federal, State or payroll 
taxes of any kind, on behalf of the Contractor or the employees of the Contractor. The Contractor is not eligible 
for, and shall not participate in, any employee pension, health or other fringe benefit plan of the Town. 

 
12. Successors and Assigns:   This Agreement is binding upon the parties hereto, their successors, assigns and legal 

representatives. Neither the Town nor the Contractor shall assign or transfer any interest in the Agreement 
without the written consent of the other. 

 
13. Inspection and Reports:   The Town shall have the right to inspect the records of the Contractor relative to the 

services provided to the Town pursuant to this Agreement. Upon request the Contractor shall furnish to the 
Town any and all written reports relative to such services arising out of its operations under this Contract during 
and/or after the termination of the contract. 
 

14. Termination:    
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a. For Cause – The Town shall have the right to terminate this Agreement if (i) the Contractor neglects or 
fails to perform or observe any of its obligations hereunder and a cure is not effected by the Contractor 
within seven (7) days next following its receipt of a termination notice issued by the Town, (ii) if an 
order is entered against the Contractor approving a petition for an arrangement, liquidation, dissolution 
or similar relief relating to bankruptcy or insolvency and such order remains unvacated for thirty (30) 
days; or (iii) immediately if the Contractor shall file a voluntary petition in bankruptcy or any petition 
or answer seeking any arrangement, liquidation or dissolution relating to bankruptcy, insolvency or 
other relief for debtors or shall seek or consent or acquiesce in appointment of any trustee, receiver or 
liquidation of any of the Contractor’s property.  
 
The Town shall pay all reasonable and supportable costs incurred prior to termination, which payment 
shall not exceed the value of services provided. 
  

b. For Convenience – The Town may terminate this Agreement at any time for any reason upon 
submitting to the Contractor thirty (30) days prior a written notice of its intention to terminate. Upon 
receipt of such notice, the Contractor shall immediately cease to incur expenses pursuant to this 
Agreement unless otherwise directed in the Town’s termination notice. The Contractor shall promptly 
notify the Town of costs incurred to date of termination and the Town shall pay all such reasonable and 
supportable costs which payment shall not exceed the unpaid balance due on this Agreement. 
  

c. Return of Property – Upon termination, the Contractor shall immediately return to the Town, without 
limitation, all documents and items of any nature whatever, supplied to the Contractor by the Town or 
developed by the Contractor in accordance with this Agreement. 

 
15. Notice:   Any and all notices, or other communications required or permitted under this Contract, shall be in 

writing and delivered by hand or mailed postage prepaid, return receipt requested, be registered or certified mail 
or by other reputable delivery service, to the parties at the address set forth on Page 1 or furnished from time to 
time in writing hereafter by one party to the other party. Any such notice or correspondence shall be deemed 
given when so delivered by hand, if so mailed, when deposited with the U.S. Postal Service or, if sent by private 
overnight or other delivery service. 
  

16. Severability:   If any term of this Contractor application thereof shall to any extent be held invalid, illegal or 
unenforceable by the court of competent jurisdiction, legality, and enforceability of the remaining terms and 
conditions of the Contract shall not be deemed affected thereby unless one or both parties would be 
substantially or materially prejudiced. 

 
17. Governing Law:   The performance of this Contract shall be governed, construed and enforced in accordance 

with the laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts, Claims and Disputes and Resolution Procedure. Claims, 
disputes, or other matters in question with the Town and Contractor or any other party claiming rights under this 
Agreement relating to or arising from the Project, the Work, or interpretation of any terms of the Contract or 
Contract Documents shall be resolved only by a civil action commenced in the Commonwealth of 
Massachusetts in either the Superior Court Department, Norfolk County, or the District Court Department, 
Dedham Division, of Massachusetts Trial Court; in the alternative, private arbitration or mediation may be 
employed if the parties mutually agree in writing to do so. 

 
18. Entire Agreement:   This Contract, including all documents incorporated herein by reference, constitutes the 

entire integrated agreement between the parties with respect to the matters described. This contract supersedes 
all prior agreements; negotiations, either written or oral and it shall not be modified or amended except by a 
written document executed by the parties hereto. 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this Agreement on this day and 
year first above written. 

  

(Contractor)       Board of Selectmen 
 
 
By: ____________________________________   ____________________________________ 
 
Title: ___________________________________   ____________________________________ 
    
        ____________________________________ 
 
         
   
       
Approved as to Form:   _____      Town of Medfield, MA  
  
     
 
____________________________________  _______ ____________________________________ 
Mark G. Cerel, Town Attorney        Kristine Trierweiler, Town Administrator 
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CERTIFICATION OF GOOD FAITH 
 

The undersigned certifies under pains and penalties of perjury that this contract has been obtained in good faith and 

without collusion or fraud with any other person.  As used in this certification, the word “person” shall mean any 

natural person, business, partnership, corporation, union, committee, club, or other organization, entity, or group of 

individuals. 

The Contractor by:  ________________________________________ 
    Print Name 
 
 
    ________________________________________ 
    Title/Authority 
 

 

 

 

CERTIFICATE OF STATE TAX COMPLIANCE 

 

 Pursuant to Massachusetts General Laws, Chapter 62C, Section 49A 

_____________________________________, authorized signatory for  
 name of signatory 
 
___________________________________________________, whose  

                                name of contractor 
 

principal place of business is at _________________________________________________, 

 _____________________________does hereby certify under the pains and penalties of perjury that 
_________________________________________________________ has paid all  

name of contractor 
 

Massachusetts taxes and has complied with all laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts relating to taxes, 
reporting of employees and contractors, and withholding and remitting child support. 

 

 

       ___________________________________ 
Signature    Date
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EXAMPLE CLERK’S CERTIFICATE 

_______________________________ 

Action of Shareholders 

Written Consent 

(Date) 

 The undersigned, being the Shareholders of ________________________, a Massachusetts Corporation 
(the "Corporation") entitled to vote on the action, hereby consent to the adoption of the following votes: 

VOTED: That the [President and/or the Vice President or named individual], each of them acting 
singly is, authorized to execute any and all contract documents and to enter into and 
negotiate the terms of all contracts and to accomplish same and to execute any and all 
documents, instruments, and agreements in order to effectuate the transaction and that 
said transaction shall be valid, binding, effective, and legally enforceable. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time, in 
the name and on behalf of the Corporation to take or cause to be taken all such action(s) 
as s/he or they, as the case may be, deem necessary, appropriate or advisable to effect the 
foregoing votes, as may be shown by the officer or officers execution or performance 
which shall be conclusive evidence that the same is authorized by the directors of this 
Corporation. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time, in 
the name and on behalf of this Corporation, under its corporate seal, if desired, attested 
by an appropriate officer, if desired, to execute, make oath to, acknowledge, deliver and 
file any and all of the agreements, instruments, certificates and documents referred to or 
related to the foregoing votes. 

 VOTED: That the officers are, and each of them acting singly is, authorized, from time to time and 
on behalf of this Corporation, under its corporate seal, if desired, to execute, 
acknowledge and deliver any and all agreements, instruments, certificates and documents 
referred to or related to the foregoing votes, with such changes as the officer or officers 
so acting may deem necessary or desirable, and the signature of such officer or officers to 
be conclusive evidence that the same is authorized by the directors of this Corporation. 

Clerk of Corporation Certificate 

 

I, ___________________________ the Clerk of the foregoing corporation, do hereby certify that the above vote was 
taken at a duly called meeting of the shareholders of the Corporation on _____________, 20__. 

 
____________________________ 
Clerk of Corporation 
 

SEAL 



 

ATTACHMENT 

 

A 



DATE 10/7/2022
6 Industrial Road Quotation # 575
Milford MA 01747 Customer ID
Phone: 508-488-6867

Quotation For: Quotation valid until: 12/7/2022

Name Maurice Goulet Prepared by: Aaron Uehara
Company Name Town of Medfield 
Street Address 135 N Meadows Rd
City, ST  ZIP Code Medfield MA
Phone

mgoulet@medfield.net

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

50 Picked up unit 35.00$                          1,750.00$                   

1 Transportation fee (per trip) 400.00$                        400.00$                      

Non-recyclable surcharge 10.00$                          

Rejectable surcharge 15.00$                          

Total 2,150.00$                   

Other -$                            

If you have any questions concerning this quotation, contact Aaron Uehara, 508-488-6867, 
pickup@greenmattressco.com.

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!

Comments or Special Instructions: 16,000 residents, 1600/year, 133/month

***A unit is a mattress or box spring, split box springs are considered two separate units***

mailto:mgoulet@medfield.net
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Green Mattress Recycling is committed to providing the best mattress recycling service possible 

for our partners, communities and environment. While we continue to evolve and grow as a company, 

reaching the highest recycling yields possible is one of our highest priorities. To do so we rely on our 

customers to assist us in keeping their mattress and box springs in a recyclable state. When mattresses 

are not managed properly, we are unable to recycle a significant percentage of the foam and textile 

material. This results in poorer recycling outcomes, significantly higher trash costs and possible rejection 

of the mattresses. 

While we have accepted some unrecyclable and rejectable units in the past, for us to continue 

to do so will require an additional unrecyclable or rejectable surcharge.  While we anticipate that some 

of our partners may have unique needs, we are happy to discuss and attempt to accommodate where 

we can. 

Effective July 1st, we will begin to classify recyclable, non-recyclable and rejectable mattresses or 

box springs as they are picked up or delivered. We will continue to use our slips to record mattress 

conditions.   

We consider a recyclable unit to be a dry and manageable mattress or box spring. Mild and dry 

bodily fluids stains are common, and do not disqualify a unit from being recyclable. Because we unload 

and cut by hand, recyclable units must be physically manageable. Hydraulic machinery might be able to 
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delicately move units, but often results in a crumpled ball, rendering the unit unrecyclable, from a 

handling and ‘cut-by-hand' perspective. 

A non-recyclable unit is a unit that is wet and/or physically unmanageable. If a unit is wet, our 

process cannot accept the unit.  We do not have the space, physical facility or time to dry it.  If 

machinery mangles a unit before it gets to our door, again our crew is unable to recycle an otherwise 

recyclable material. 

A rejectable unit requires special handling and direct disposal. These are units that are unsafe to 

handle, preventing us from being able to recycle any of the material. This includes units that are infested 

with bed bugs, heavily soiled with bodily fluids (blood and feces) or other hazardous fluids, units that 

have absorbed so much water it requires multiple people to move it and/or “dead beds.”  Dead beds are 

units that have been in contact with a decomposing body creating a biohazard.  

Green Mattress Recycling understands that there may be an adjustment period.  We hope that 

we can provide enough advanced notice to avoid disruptions as your business starts to ramp up. If you 

have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact Aaron (Aaron@greenmattressco.com) or Adam 

(Adoorly@greenmattressco.com). 

Best regards, 

Green Mattress Recycling 

mailto:Aaron@greenmattressco.com
mailto:Adoorly@greenmattressco.com


Recyclable Units:
• Must be dry
• Must be in reasonable shape
• Must not be excessively dirty or rancid
• Urine stains are recyclable, unless rancid

Non-Recyclable Units
• Units that are wet
• Units that are crushed with hydraulic machinery
• Units that are excessively dirty or rancid

Rejected Units
• Are soaking wet, requiring 3+ people to move
• Are infested with bed bugs
• Are biohazardous to our crew

• “dead bed” with decomposition
• Covered in feces
• Have been used to soak up and clean waste sites















 
 
 
 
 

Informational  



 
We were unable to reach an agreement to continue carrying Nexstar’s programming 
before our agreement expired on October 14, 2022.  We do not currently have the rights to 
provide this programming, and it will be temporarily removed from the Fios TV lineup. 
  
Rest assured, we understand that you value Nexstar’s content, and we are working  
hard to reach a deal that will allow you to keep enjoying the programming you love. 
 
For a full list of channels affected and updates, visit verizon.com/Nexstar. 
 
 
 








